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Only a farmer could delve so deeply into the origins of food, and only a writer of Wendell Berry’s caliber
could convey it with such conviction and eloquence. Long before Whole Foods organic produce was
available at your local supermarket, Berry was farming with the purity of food in mind. For the last five
decades, Berry has embodied mindful eating through his land practices and his writing. In recognition of that
influence, Michael Pollan here offers an introduction to this wonderful collection.

Drawn from over thirty years of work, this collection joins bestsellers The Omnivore’s Dilemma, by Pollan,
and Animal, Vegetable, Miracle, by Barbara Kingsolver, as essential reading for anyone who cares about
what they eat. The essays address such concerns as: How does organic measure up against locally grown?
What are the differences between small and large farms, and how does that affect what you put on your
dinner table? What can you do to support sustainable agriculture?

A progenitor of the Slow Food movement, Wendell Berry reminds us all to take the time to understand the
basics of what we ingest. “Eating is an agriculture act,” he writes. Indeed, we are all players in the food
economy.
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From reader reviews:

Sarah Maddocks:

Why don't make it to be your habit? Right now, try to prepare your time to do the important action, like
looking for your favorite publication and reading a e-book. Beside you can solve your short lived problem;
you can add your knowledge by the book entitled Bringing It to the Table: On Farming and Food. Try to the
actual book Bringing It to the Table: On Farming and Food as your good friend. It means that it can to be
your friend when you feel alone and beside that course make you smarter than previously. Yeah, it is very
fortuned for you. The book makes you far more confidence because you can know every little thing by the
book. So , let us make new experience along with knowledge with this book.

Lurline Silvester:

Often the book Bringing It to the Table: On Farming and Food has a lot of information on it. So when you
make sure to read this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was compiled by the very famous author.
The author makes some research prior to write this book. This book very easy to read you can obtain the
point easily after scanning this book.

Sidney Robertson:

The book untitled Bringing It to the Table: On Farming and Food contain a lot of information on it. The
writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do not worry,
you can easy to read this. The book was compiled by famous author. The author brings you in the new period
of time of literary works. It is easy to read this book because you can continue reading your smart phone, or
gadget, so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. If you want to buy the e-book, you can
start their official web-site in addition to order it. Have a nice learn.

Verna Hibbard:

Reading a book make you to get more knowledge as a result. You can take knowledge and information from
the book. Book is composed or printed or created from each source that filled update of news. Within this
modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for an individual. From media social just
like newspaper, magazines, science reserve, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You can add
your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just trying to find
the Bringing It to the Table: On Farming and Food when you desired it?
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