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One of the greatest graphic novels of all-time, in an expanded, hardcover edition?the full graphic
novel, the complete script of the Oscar-nominated movie, and over 30 pages of rare ephemera.

Originally released in 1997 as a limited hardcover edition of 2,500 copies that sold out almost instantly,
Ghost World has subsequently gone through 18 softcover printings, selling in excess of 150,000 copies in the
United States, becoming one of the best-selling and most revered graphic novels of all-time, culminating in
the 2001 Academy Award-nominated film.

To commemorate the tenth anniversary, Fantagraphics Books released this deluxe, expanded Ghost World
special edition in 2008, combining the original graphic novel, the Oscar-nominated screenplay adaptation by
Clowes and Terry Zwigoff, as well as over two dozen pages of rare and obscure bonus material in one book,
along with a new cover and introduction.

Ghost World is the story of Becky and Enid, two teenaged girls and best friends facing the prospect of not
only growing up, but growing apart from each other. Clowes paints a tender picture of this intellectually
precocious, sexually adventurous (despite a mutual lack of experience), and formative period in their lives,
filtered through a blue hue echoing a world lit by the cathode rays of a television ? a perfect metaphor for
their post- nuclear existence. Both naturalistic and nostalgic, Ghost World carves a layered narrative out of
the daily existence of these fully-realized young women.

Ghost World: The Special Edition included the original, 80-page graphic novel; the out-of-print, Oscar-
nominated 106-page screenplay; the little-seen comic strip created for the Ghost World soundtrack; and over
30 pages of rare ephemera related to the book and film, including covers to foreign editions of Ghost World,
rare promotional art, pictures, sketches and much more. 116 full-color pages and 116 black-and-white pages
of comics
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From reader reviews:

Christopher Cunningham:

The book Ghost World: The Special Edition gives you the sense of being enjoy for your spare time. You can
use to make your capable more increase. Book can being your best friend when you getting stress or having
big problem along with your subject. If you can make examining a book Ghost World: The Special Edition
to get your habit, you can get more advantages, like add your capable, increase your knowledge about many
or all subjects. It is possible to know everything if you like available and read a e-book Ghost World: The
Special Edition. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science guide or encyclopedia or others. So , how
do you think about this reserve?

Vickie Miller:

Nowadays reading books are more than want or need but also get a life style. This reading routine give you
lot of advantages. The huge benefits you got of course the knowledge the actual information inside the book
that improve your knowledge and information. The data you get based on what kind of reserve you read, if
you want send more knowledge just go with education and learning books but if you want truly feel happy
read one using theme for entertaining such as comic or novel. Typically the Ghost World: The Special
Edition is kind of publication which is giving the reader unpredictable experience.

Thomas Moss:

Book is one of source of know-how. We can add our expertise from it. Not only for students and also native
or citizen need book to know the up-date information of year in order to year. As we know those ebooks
have many advantages. Beside we all add our knowledge, could also bring us to around the world. From the
book Ghost World: The Special Edition we can take more advantage. Don't that you be creative people? To
become creative person must prefer to read a book. Merely choose the best book that appropriate with your
aim. Don't become doubt to change your life at this book Ghost World: The Special Edition. You can more
inviting than now.

Clara Duke:

Many people said that they feel weary when they reading a publication. They are directly felt the item when
they get a half regions of the book. You can choose often the book Ghost World: The Special Edition to
make your reading is interesting. Your current skill of reading proficiency is developing when you including
reading. Try to choose easy book to make you enjoy to see it and mingle the impression about book and
reading especially. It is to be very first opinion for you to like to open up a book and examine it. Beside that
the book Ghost World: The Special Edition can to be your brand-new friend when you're truly feel alone and
confuse in doing what must you're doing of their time.
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