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Fifty years ago, Norman Mailer asserted, "William Burroughs is the only American novelist living today
who may conceivably be possessed by genius." Few since have taken such literary risks, developed such
individual political or spiritual ideas, or spanned such a wide range of media. Burroughs wrote novels,
memoirs, technical manuals, and poetry. He painted, made collages, took thousands of photographs,
produced hundreds of hours of experimental recordings, acted in movies, and recorded more CDs than most
rock bands. Burroughs was the original cult figure of the Beat Movement, and with the publication of his
novel Naked Lunch, which was originally banned for obscenity, he became a guru to the 60s youth
counterculture. In CALL ME BURROUGHS, biographer and Beat historian Barry Miles presents the first
full-length biography of Burroughs to be published in a quarter century-and the first one to chronicle the last
decade of Burroughs's life and examine his long-term cultural legacy.
Written with the full support of the Burroughs estate and drawing from countless interviews with figures like
Allen Ginsberg, Lucien Carr, and Burroughs himself, CALL ME BURROUGHS is a rigorously researched
biography that finally gets to the heart of its notoriously mercurial subject.
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From reader reviews:

Katrina Varga:

In this 21st centuries, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive right now,
people have do something to make these survives, being in the middle of the actual crowded place and notice
by means of surrounding. One thing that often many people have underestimated that for a while is reading.
Yeah, by reading a publication your ability to survive increase then having chance to stand than other is high.
For you who want to start reading some sort of book, we give you this specific Call Me Burroughs: A Life
book as nice and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a book.

Mary Hopkins:

Are you kind of stressful person, only have 10 or maybe 15 minute in your day time to upgrading your mind
ability or thinking skill perhaps analytical thinking? Then you are experiencing problem with the book than
can satisfy your limited time to read it because all this time you only find guide that need more time to be
learn. Call Me Burroughs: A Life can be your answer since it can be read by anyone who have those short
time problems.

Linda Wood:

That guide can make you to feel relax. That book Call Me Burroughs: A Life was vibrant and of course has
pictures around. As we know that book Call Me Burroughs: A Life has many kinds or type. Start from kids
until teenagers. For example Naruto or Private investigator Conan you can read and believe that you are the
character on there. So , not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it can make you feel happy, fun
and chill out. Try to choose the best book for yourself and try to like reading which.

Melvin Lucero:

As a university student exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher questioned them to go to the
library or to make summary for some e-book, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart
or real their interest. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there
but nothing reading critically. Any students feel that studying is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful pictures on there. Yeah, it is being complicated. Book is very important in your case. As we know
that on this time, many ways to get whatever we would like. Likewise word says, ways to reach Chinese's
country. Therefore this Call Me Burroughs: A Life can make you truly feel more interested to read.
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