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This updated Edition (2014) expands on the Irish edition (2011), the American Edition (2012) and brings the
story totally current. It continues the compelling narrative of Fr. Mc Manus’ long struggle for justice in
Ireland. The book reveals how Fr. Mc Manus prevailed against all odds ... How he refused to be silent in the
face of injustice ... And how he “kept Congress on track regarding justice and peace in Ireland.” As one
reviewer has said, “It makes one want to stand up and cheer.” It is a story of grace and courage, devotion and
determination, persistence and perseverance – without bitterness or rancor. For over forty years, Fermanagh
native Fr. Sean McManus has been at the heart of the Irish- American campaign against injustice in Northern
Ireland. This is his personal account of how he mainstreamed Northern Ireland on Capitol Hill after Church
and State exiled him from Britain in 1972 to silence him on the issue. He founded the Irish National Caucus
in 1974, “the driving force that would diminish Britain’s influence with the U.S. government.” He forced
through Congressional action to stop the sale of U.S. weapons to the RUC and made the Mac Bride
Principles on fair employment a powerful force. And all this time, he was opposed not only by the London
and Dublin governments but also – and ironically and inexplicably – by elements in the Irish Republican
Movement. Fr. Mc Manus also chronicles the events and social context that influenced his growing up in the
parish of Kinawley -- a parish divided by the British-imposed Border that partitions Ireland -- in a large
patriotic family. He gives thoughtful insights into seminary life in the 1960s, and how his faith, theology and
philosophy of non-violence developed. This book is essential reading for all who want to know about how
the U. S. Congress acted -- or failed to act -- regarding justice in Northern Ireland. It could not have been
written by anyone else, because no one has done with Congress what Fr. Mc Manus has done, so consistently
and for so long. It is has been described as the most important significant memoir in the historiography of
Irish -American nationalism since Recollection of an Irish Rebel ( 1929) by the intrepid John Devoy.
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From reader reviews:

Ethel Ellis:

Do you one of people who can't read satisfying if the sentence chained inside the straightway, hold on guys
that aren't like that. This MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN IRELAND book is
readable by you who hate the perfect word style. You will find the facts here are arrange for enjoyable
reading experience without leaving also decrease the knowledge that want to deliver to you. The writer
connected with MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN IRELAND content conveys
prospect easily to understand by many individuals. The printed and e-book are not different in the articles but
it just different as it. So , do you continue to thinking MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE
INNORTHERN IRELAND is not loveable to be your top collection reading book?

Melissa Peterson:

Reading can called head hangout, why? Because if you are reading a book particularly book entitled MY
AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN IRELAND your head will drift away trough
every dimension, wandering in every aspect that maybe mysterious for but surely will become your mind
friends. Imaging every word written in a reserve then become one web form conclusion and explanation in
which maybe you never get ahead of. The MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN
IRELAND giving you one more experience more than blown away the mind but also giving you useful
details for your better life on this era. So now let us present to you the relaxing pattern at this point is your
body and mind will probably be pleased when you are finished reading it, like winning a. Do you want to try
this extraordinary investing spare time activity?

Marylou Standley:

The book untitled MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN IRELAND contain a lot of
information on it. The writer explains your ex idea with easy way. The language is very clear and
understandable all the people, so do not really worry, you can easy to read it. The book was authored by
famous author. The author will bring you in the new age of literary works. You can actually read this book
because you can read more your smart phone, or program, so you can read the book within anywhere and
anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book, you can open their official web-site and order it.
Have a nice read.

Catherine Gates:

Beside this kind of MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE INNORTHERN IRELAND in your
phone, it might give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or details. The information and the
knowledge you may got here is fresh in the oven so don't end up being worry if you feel like an outdated
people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have MY AMERICAN STRUGGLEFOR JUSTICE
INNORTHERN IRELAND because this book offers for you readable information. Do you sometimes have



book but you would not get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in the hand.
The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, like treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want
to miss the item? Find this book and also read it from at this point!
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